INITIAL STATEMENT OF REASONS
FOR
PROPOSED BUILDING STANDARDS
OF THE
OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL (SFM)
REGARDING THE ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF THE
2009 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC)
WITH AMENDMENTS INTO THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE (CBC)
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 2

The Administrative Procedure Act requires that an Initial Statement of Reasons be available to the public upon request
when rulemaking action is being undertaken. The following are the reasons for proposing this particular rulemaking
action:

STATEMENT OF SPECIFIC PURPOSE AND RATIONALE
(Government Code Section 11346.2)

The specific purpose of this rulemaking effort by the Office of the State Fire Marshal is to act accordance with Health and
Safety Code section 18928, which requires all proposed regulations to specifically comply with this section in regards to
the adoption by reference with amendments to a model code within one year after its publication.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and be published as the 2010
California Building Code.

The general purpose of this proposed action is principally intended to update and codify a new edition of the California
Building Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2) based upon a more current edition of a model code. The
current California Building Code in effect is the 2007 California Building Code which is based upon the 2006 International
Building Code of the International Code Council. This proposed action:

¢ Repeal the adoption by reference of the 2006 International Building Code of the International Code Council
and incorporate and adopt by reference in its place the 2009 International Building Code of the International
Code Council for application and effectiveness in the 2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and
Safety Code 18928. Health and Safety Code 18928 requires any state agency adopting model codes to adopt
the most recent edition.

e Repeal certain amendments to the 2006 International Building Code and/or California Building Standards not
addressed by the model code that are no longer necessary pursuant with Health and Safety Code
18930(a)(7)..

e Adopt new building standards or necessary amendments to the 2009 International Building Code that address
inadequacies of the 2009 International Building Code as they pertain to California laws.

e  Bring forward previously existing California building standards or amendments, which represent no change in
their effect from the 2007 California Building Standards Code.

e Codify non-substantive editorial and formatting amendments from the format based upon the 2006
International Building Code to the format of the 2009 International Building Code.

The specific purpose and rationale of each adoption, amendment, or repeal is as follows:

Office of the State Fire Marshal 1 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



[1]

CHAPTER 1
DIVISION I
CALIFORNIA GENERAL CODE PROVISIONS

The SFM propose to create two Divisions within Chapter 1 for existing administrative provisions being brought forward and
administrative provisions contained in the 2009 IBC. The creation of two divisions is a result of and direction made by the
California Building Standards Commissions, Code Coordinating Council and Stakeholder discussions regarding relocating
the base model code administrative provisions from an appendix to Chapter 1 of the code. The SFM proposes to
distinguish the California Chapter 1 administrative provisions from those of the base model code Chapter 1 administrative
provisions by renumbering the California administrative sections.

Sections 1.1 -1.1.12

The SFM is proposing to maintain the adoption of those existing California regulations contained Sections 1.1 through
1.1.12 with modification.

The SFM proposes to update the IBC reference from 2006 to 2009, and to make changes to provide consistency with
other Parts of Title 24, administrative provisions. The SFM proposes to make nonsubstantive reference, grammatical, and
punctuation corrections to Sections 1.1 through 1.1.12 for consistency with the Chapter 1, General Code Provisions of
Title 24, Parts 2, 3, 4, 5, and 9. The SFM proposes madifications to 1.1.5 to further clarify that the National Fire Code also
include the National Fire Code Standards by adding the term “standards”. The SFM proposes modifications to Section
1.1.8.1 are proposed to revise the mailing address for the Department of Housing and Community Developments (HCD)
from a physical address to a post office box for mailings of findings to be filed with HCD. The SFM proposes modifications
to clarify in Section 1.1.10 that complete copies of specified California Code of Regulations Titles are required to be
maintained at the building official's office. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

[1.1]
Sections 1.11 -111.10

The SFM is proposing to maintain the adoption of those existing California regulations contained Sections 1.11 through
1.11.10 with modification.

SFM proposes to make nonsubstantive reference, grammatical, and punctuation corrections to Sections 1.11 through
1.11.10 for consistency with the Chapter 1, General Code Provisions of Title 24, Parts 2, 3, 4, 5, and 9. SFM proposes
modifications to 1.11.1 to further clarify the authority and reference for applications regulated by the SFM. SFM proposes
modifications to clarify in Section 1.11.2.1.2 enforcement responsibilities for state owned buildings, state occupied
buildings, and state institutions. SFM proposes modifications to remove obsolete language and terminology from Section
1.11.3.1 for public school plans and specifications and annual submission. These amendments do not create a change in
regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 2 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



[1.2]

CHAPTER 1
DIVISION I

The SFM proposes the Division Il designation for the IBC Chapter 1 Administrative provisions - Sections 101 through 114.

The SFM proposes to adopt specific Sections of Chapter 1, Division Il with the amendment and California regulation. The
SFM proposes to adopt only those Sections listed in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

(2]

CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 2 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore, the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California definitions or model code definitions as amended in Chapter 2 without
modification. The SFM is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix
Adoption Table pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and
18949.2.

Section 202 Definitions.

CONGREGATE LIVING FACILITIES
The SFM proposes remove the above IBC definition to eliminate conflict with California licensed facilities classified by
statute as further defined in the CBC. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

HIGH-RISE BUILDING

The SFM is proposing to remove IBC language defining “High-rise Buildings” that conflicts with the statutory provisions of
Health and Safety Code 13210 and that are further defined in CBC Section 403.1.3. These amendments do not create a
change in regulatory effect.

PHOTOLUMINESCENT

The SFM is proposing to repeal the current California definition of “photoluminescent” due to revisions made to the IBC
that that now defines “photoluminescent” making the California definition no longer necessary. These amendments do not
create a change in regulatory effect.

PORTABLE BUILDING

The SFM is proposing to further clarify the definition of “Portable Building”. Such portable buildings may be classified as
other than Group E yet are subject to the provisions for public schools when housing or serving students from kindergarten
through twelfth grade and funded pursuant to the California Education Code commencing with Section 17070.10. These
amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

PORTABLE BUILDING, EXEMPTED

The SFMis relocating provisions contained in 907.2.3.8.3 that define “Exempt Portable Buildings” to chapter 2 definitions,
which are correlated with the existing definition or “Portable Building” as they relate to school facilities. This modification
has no change in regulatory effect.

PROTECTIVE SOCIAL CARE FACILITY
The above definition as amended or California definitions are brought forward with modification. The 2007 California

Office of the State Fire Marshal 3 0f 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Building Code contains a number of regulations and exceptions to regulations that apply to facilities which provide
Protective Social Care. For example, Section 509.9 establishes specific setback and opening requirements. Section
907.2.8.4 contains exceptions to manual and automatic fire alarm systems for R4 occupancies if the facility provides
Protective Social Care.

The portion of the current definition that is problematic for local enforcement authorities is the term “referred”. Despite the
regulations neither the California Building Code nor the Health and Safety Code define what a referral is.

Section 1500, et.seq. of the Health and Safety Code, the California Community Care Facilities Act, contains the
description of several types of community care facilities from which referrals and placements are made by specific
governmental agencies. These agencies include the Department of Social Services, Department of Corrections, probation
departments, adult and juvenile courts, child welfare agencies, etc. These agencies not only refer and place clients within
community care facilities but they also pay the community care facilities for some, if not all of the cost of the care. The
referral / placement and compensation nexus makes it easy to identify facilities providing care to clients of these agencies
as Protective Social Care facilities.

Drug and Alcohol Recovery or Treatment (DART) facilities do not fall under Section 1500 of Health and Safety Code,
however, they are subject to referrals by governmental agencies as well. Referrals may be in the form of sentencing
alternatives, sentence reductions or conditions of probation.

Unlike clients who receive services under the California Community Care Facilities Act, clients receiving services in a
DART facility due to a Penal Code Section 1000 or “Drinking Driver” diversion programs may not be having those services
paid for by a governmental agency. While they may have indeed been referred to recovery services by a governmental
agency, they may be free to select any facility that is on their County’s list of approved programs. In these circumstances
where a client is free to select a facility and must pay for services out of pocket, there is no practical difference between
DART referred clients and those who walk in to a facility of their own accord.

The proposed change in the definition is intended to assist code officials in determining when a care facility should be
treated in accordance with the Protective Social Care provisions and when it should not.

RESIDENTAL-CARE/ASSISTED-LIMING-FACILITHES
The SFM proposes remove the above IBC definition to eliminate conflict with California licensed facilities classified by
statute as further defined in the CBC. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

RESTRAINT

The SFM is proposing to revise the occupancy classification in the definition of “restraint” to coordinate with modifications
proposed that reclassify Group I-1 to Group R-2.1 occupancies in this rulemaking. The SFM is also proposing to revise
the section reference due to revisions made to the IBC that revised provisions for Group I-3 occupancies. These
amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

SELF-LUMINGUS

The SFM is proposing to repeal the current California definition of “self-luminous” due to revisions made to the IBC that
that now defines “self-luminous” making the California definition no longer necessary. These amendments do not create a
change in regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

(3]

CHAPTER 3
BUILDING PLANNING

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 3 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 3 without modification. The SFM

Office of the State Fire Marshal 4 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

302.1

The SFM is including Group R-2.1 occupancy classification to the residential occupancy classification due to the occupancy
reclassification of I-1 occupancies. See the purpose and rational for Section 310.1 for additional information. There is no
change in regulatory effect.

304.1

The SFM is proposing to modify this new IBC occupancy to correlate with existing SFM provisions for Group 1-2.1 Ambulatory
Care Facilities in Section 308.3.2. The SFM proposes to repeal reference to Group 1-2.1 occupancies for clinics as a
result of the new IBC provisions for ambulatory health care facilities. Furthermore the above amended Sections as
amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

305.2

The SFM is making additional editorial revisions to correct the age limitation derived from thee statutory definition of infant,
to correlate existing SFM and Department of Social Services, Community Care Licensing Division Title 22 regulations and
terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC.

308.2

The SFM proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310. Group I-1 occupancies
are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than
6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification
and relocation.

During the promulgation of the 2007 California Codes the SFM sought to utilize the base model code provisions as much as
possible. The SFM consolidated the existing Residential Care Facilities that were classified as Group R-2.1, R-2.3 and R-6.1
into that of the group I-1 occupancy classification. The consolidation of these occupancies into one has lessened confusion and
has made for consistent design, enforcement and use. However, classification of Group I-1 for these residential in nature type
facilities has been problematic for designers, providers and enforcing agencies. Such problems as which disabled access
provisions apply and zoning for residential Vs institutional are of the greatest concern. This proposed reclassification will resolve
both and have no change in regulatory effect.

308.3

308.3.1 Definitions

CHILD CARE FACILITIES

DETOXIFICATION FACILITIES

HOSPITALS AND MENTAL HOSPITALS

NURSING HOMES

Except as identified herein, the above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought
forward with modification. Existing statutory and regulatory provisions for non-ambulatory and bedridden are proposed.

The SFM is proposing modification to include statutory provisions that limit the number of clients or children that may be
housed in a child care facility and nursing homes. These limitations are also coordinated with other occupancy
classifications that set a minimum and/or maximum number of clients, including Groups I-2, I-4, R-2.1, R-3.1 and R-4
occupancies. The SFM is making additional editorial revisions to correct the age limitation derived from thee statutory
definition of infant, to correlate existing SFM and Department of Social Services, Community Care Licensing Division Title
22 regulations and terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC.

308.3.2
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.4
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.3.2
308.4

Office of the State Fire Marshal 5 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM is proposing to relocated the definitions contained in Section 308.4.6 to 408.1.1 which will coincide with revisions
made to the model code restructuring. See purpose and rational statement for 408.1.1 for additional information. There is
no change in regulatory effect.

308.5

Except as identified herein, the above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought
forward without modification. The SFM is making additional editorial revisions to coincide with other existing California
regulations and terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC. Additional modifications proposed reinstate the model
code provisions previously removed that reference to the International Residential code with modification to reference the
California Residential Code. There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.5.1
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.5.2

The above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought forward without modification. The
SFM is making additional editorial revisions to correct the age limitation derived from thee statutory definition of infant, to
correlate existing SFM and Department of Social Services, Community Care Licensing Division Title 22 regulations and
terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC.

There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.5.2.1
The above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

310.1

The SFM modifications proposed reinstate the model code provisions previously removed that reference to the
International Residential code with modification to reference the California Residential Code. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

(310.1)

R-2.1

The SFM Proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies from section 308.2 to Section 310 under
the Group R-2.1 occupancy classification. Group I-1 occupancies are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1
occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than 6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing
regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification and relocation.

During the promulgation of the 2007 California Codes the SFM sought to utilize the base model code provisions as much as
possible. The SFM consolidated the existing Residential Care Facilities that were classified as Group R-2.1, R-2.3 and R-6.1
into that of the group I-1 occupancy classification. The consolidation of these occupancies into one has lessened confusion and
has made for consistent design, enforcement and use. However, classification of Group I-1 for these residential in nature type
facilities has been problematic for designers, providers and enforcing agencies. Such problems as which disabled access
provisions apply and zoning for residential Vs institutional are of the greatest concern. This proposed reclassification will resolve
both and have no change in regulatory effect.

(310.1)

Office of the State Fire Marshal 6 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



R-3
The SFM is proposing to include Group R-2.1 occupancies for clarity to be listed with other occupancies when classifying
a Group R-3 (see additional purpose and rational for Group R-2.1 occupancies below).

The SFM is proposing to reinstate model code provisions with modification, and include statutory provisions that limit the
number of clients or children that may be housed in a Group R-3 used for day care purposes. These limitations are also
coordinated with other occupancy classifications that set a minimum and/or maximum number of clients, including Groups
I-2, 1-4, R-2.1, R-3.1 and R-4 occupancies.

The SFM is proposing additional amendments that correct the term for “Adult Day Programs”. Legislation amended
Sections 1502, 1523.1, and 1531.2 added Section 1530.1 and repealed Section 1520.2 of the Health and Safety Code.
Adult day facilities and adult day support centers have been consolidated into a single category called “Adult Day
Program.” The legislation requires the Department of Social Services (DSS) to adopt regulations to combine the existing
categories into this single program, these modifications are to correlate with DSS and implement the legislative revisions
made to Health and Safety Code.

(310.1)

R-3.1

The SFM is proposing to include Group R-2.1 occupancies for clarity to be listed with other occupancies when classifying
a Group R-3 (see additional purpose and rational for Group R-2.1 occupancies above).

(310.1)

R-4

The SFM is proposing to reinstate model code provisions with modification, and include statutory provisions that limit the
number of clients that may be housed in a Group R-4 residential care/assisted living facilities. These limitations are also
coordinated with other occupancy classifications that set a minimum and/or maximum number of clients, including Groups
1-2, 1-4, R-2.1, R-3.1 and R-4 occupancies.

310.2 Definitions

DAY-CARE HOME, FAMILY

The SFM is proposing to include the definition of “DAY-CARE HOME, FAMILY” in accordance with Health and Safety
Code 1596.78. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

[4]

CHAPTER 4
SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 4 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 4 without modification. The SFM
is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

403

403.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward regarding for high-rise
buildings and I-2 occupancies. Modifications to the existing amendments are editorial only as the existing amendments are
revised to correlate with new model code language. Revisions are made to correct section references for existing high-
rise buildings. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM is further proposing to delete exception 5 of Section 403.1, which exempts Group H occupancies over 75 ft
above the lowest floor level having building access from complying with the high-rise buildings requirements of Sections
403.2 through 403.5. SFM believes that Group H occupancies should have at the minimum, equal or greater fire and life

Office of the State Fire Marshal 7 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



safety requirements to that of other high-rise building occupancies. As allowed by the building and fire code, Group H
occupancies are allowed to contain, handle and use hazardous materials far in excess of those allowed in all other
occupancies. These hazardous occupancies require more requirements for safe guarding the building occupants and
responding emergency personnel, not less. By deleting this exception Group H occupancies will be required to comply
with high-rise building requirements. This proposed amendment is consistent with the intent of California Health and
Safety Code Section 13211.

403.2

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
SFM is proposing to relocate exception 2 regarding telecommunication equipment and provisions for no automatic sprinkler
protection. This amendment is coordinated with amendments proposed to 903.2 and 903.3.1.1.1, see the purpose and rational
for 903.1.1.1 for additional information.

403.2.1.1

The SFM is proposing to exclude H-1, H-2 or H-3 occupancies from the fire-resistance rating reduction provisions in
coordination with the modifications to Section 403.1. The SFM is proposing to delete exception 5 of Section 403.1, which
exempts Group H-1, H-2 or H-3 occupancies over 75 ft above the lowest floor level having building access from complying
with the high-rise buildings requirements of Sections 403.2 through 403.5. SFM believes that Group H occupancies should
have at the minimum, equal or greater fire and life safety requirements to that of other high-rise building occupancies. As
allowed by the building and fire code, Group H occupancies are allowed to contain, handle and use hazardous materials
far in excess of those allowed in all other occupancies. These hazardous occupancies require more requirements for safe
guarding the building occupants and responding emergency personnel, not less. By deleting this exception Group H-1, H-
2 or H-3 occupancies will be required to comply with high-rise building requirements. This proposed amendment is
consistent with the intent of California Health and Safety Code Section 13211.

403.2.1.1

The SFM is proposing amendments fire-resistance reductions to clarify that the structural frame fire-resistance shall not be
reduced for high-rise buildings. This amendment is consistent with the existing SFM amendments that have been brought
forward from Section 403.3.1 and Table 601. Additional text modified to use the same terms used in the IBC allowed vs.
permitted. There is no change in regulatory effect.

403.4.8.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are being repealed as the model code
provisions of the IBC and IFC now adequately address emergency power loads for dire pumps. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

403.6

The above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought forward with modification.
Editorial revisions are made to correct section references for elevator lobby provisions. There is no change in regulatory
effect.

regulatory effect.

404.6

404.9-404.10

The SFM is including Group R-2.1 occupancy classification to the residential occupancy classification due to the occupancy
reclassification of I-1 occupancies. See the purpose and rational for Section 310.1 for additional information. Sections have
been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in regulatory effect.

407.2.2
The SFM is proposing to repeal existing amendments and correlate these provisions with CCR title 19 and the CFC. The
California Fire Code contains requirements for automatic sprinkler protection and smoke detectors in Chapter 9.

Section 407.2.2, California Building Code inappropriately contains requirements for automatic sprinkler protection and
smoke detectors for nurses’ stations in new construction. Amendments to Section 407.2.2 delete automatic fire sprinkler
protection and smoke detector nurses’ station requirements from this section. New amendments reference the California
Fire Code for automatic fire sprinkler protection in nurses’ stations in existing construction and smoke detectors in nurses’
stations in new and existing construction. Because a new Group | is already required to be protected by automatic fire
sprinklers, specific requirements for automatic sprinkler protection in nurse’s stations in new construction is deleted.

Section 407.2.2, California Building Code permits the location of nurses’ stations, spaces for doctor’s and nurses’ charting,

Office of the State Fire Marshal 8 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



communications and related clerical areas to be open to an exit access corridor. In health care facilities where nurses’
stations, doctors’ and nurses’ charting and communications stations are located, it is often necessary to have limited
amounts of combustible storage, paperwork and equipment in these areas to facilitate essential health care activities by
medical personnel. An amendment to 407.2.2 references the requirements of Section 3.11(d) of Title 19 which limits
combustibles and equipment to reasonable quantities. This amendment will provide for coordination with storage and
equipment requirements contained in amended Sec. 3.11(d) of Title 19. Heretofore these requirements have been subject
to varied interpretations and applications by OSHPD, the State Fire Marshal and local fire authorities.

408.1.1 Definition

CELL

CELL

CELL COMPLEX

CELLTHER

CELL TIERS

The SFM is proposing to relocate these existing California definitions for detention facilities from 308.4.6 here to correlate
with the 2009 IBC revised format. Furthermore SFM is removing those IBC definitions that conflict with the existing
California definitions. Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without
modification. There is no change in regulatory effect.

CENTRAL CONTROL BUILDING

The SFM is proposing the definition of Central Control Building to correlate with provisions proposed for fenced enclosures
adjacent to the Central Control Building detention facilities. See purpose and rational for Section 408.3.6.5 for additional
information

DAY ROOM

DORMITORY

HOLDING FACILITY

HOUSING-UNIT

HOUSING UNIT

RESTRAINT

SALLYPORT

The SFM is proposing to relocate these existing California definitions for detention facilities from 308.4.6 here to correlate
with the 2009 IBC revised format. Furthermore SFM is removing those IBC definitions that conflict with the existing
California definitions. Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without
modification. There is no change in regulatory effect.

SMALL MANAGEMENT YARD

The SFM is proposing to include provisions for small management yards in detention facilities. The SFM is proposing
these provisions to provide a safe, adequately protected and code compliant environment for inmates to be provided out of
cell exercise time.

Under California Department of Corrections and Rehabilitation (CDCR) presiding over Title 15, Section 3343, Conditions
of Segregation Housing Unit (ASU) will be provided ten hours per week of out of cell exercise. Judge Karlton, the Coleman
Lawsuit, issued an order directing the CDCR to construct Small Management Yards to meet Title 15 exercise
requirements for ASU inmates by June 30, 2009. An inmate typically occupies these exterior exercise yards approximately
2 hours each day five days a week to satisfy the outside exercise requirements. The exercise currently is comprised of
free movement within an enclosed space of approximately 150 square feet. The inmates have no equipment when they
occupy these yards. These yards are not used to storage of any materials or equipment and there no electrical devices or
outlets accessible to the inmates. The California Building Code does not address the minimum requirements for these
exercise yards. Typically, these yards are located adjacent to 270 housing units, away from the general population
exercise yards.

The occupancy for covered exercise yards is |-3, as any other building within the institution where inmates are confined.
The construction type is Type I-B, with all materials being non-combustible, as follows:

e  Structure: steel posts or steel tubes

o Wall materials: steel plate or steel crimp-lock welded wire mesh

e Fire proofing of these materials is not required.

Fire alarms and sprinklers should not be required provided the yards are a minimum of 10 feet away from all buildings,

Office of the State Fire Marshal 9 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



structures or fences, and the yard covering does not exceed 50% of the fenced enclosure.
Officers in charge of yards shall have personal alarms and radios to notify central control in case of fire.

Each yard is to provide exercise for a maximum of two inmates at a time. Exercise yards are 10 foot by 15 foot with a
design minimum of 75 square feet per inmate.

408.3.6.5

The SFM is proposing to include provisions for fenced enclosures for the sub-armory in detention facilities. The fenced
enclosure adjacent to the Central Control Building is a security perimeter for the sub-armory, which is an unmanned
weapons storage structure. Occupancy of this area will only occur during emergency response conditions, with a
maximum capacity of 29 staff members for a short duration (approximately 10 minutes per incident). Due to the high
volume of inmate movement within the surrounding area, only designated personnel will occupy this area during the
assignment of weapons from the storage structure. Because of the security requirements during this operation and the
lack of permanent staff occupancy of this location, we are requesting to restrict the number of gates into this enclosure to
one. The gate operation will be conducted remotely from the adjacent tower, with an option of being manually operated
with a key. Minimizing access to a single gate into the fence enclosure is essential for maintaining the appropriate level of
armed supervision and access control by the tower.

408.5

408.5.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Editorial revisions are made to correct section references for shaft provisions There is no change in regulatory effect.

408:14-408.13

The SFM is including Group R-2.1 occupancy classification to the residential occupancy classification due to the occupancy
reclassification of I-1 occupancies. See the purpose and rational for Section 310.1 for additional information. There is no
change in regulatory effect.

408.14 through 408.14.5

The SFM is proposing to include provisions for small management yards in detention facilities. The SFM is proposing
these provisions to provide a safe, adequately protected and code compliant environment for inmates to be provided out of
cell exercise time.

Under California Department of Corrections and Rehabilitation (CDCR) presiding over Title 15, Section 3343, Conditions
of Segregation Housing Unit (ASU) will be provided ten hours per week of out of cell exercise. Judge Karlton, the Coleman
Lawsuit, issued an order directing the CDCR to construct Small Management Yards to meet Title 15 exercise
requirements for ASU inmates by June 30, 2009. An inmate typically occupies these exterior exercise yards approximately
2 hours each day five days a week to satisfy the outside exercise requirements. The exercise currently is comprised of
free movement within an enclosed space of approximately 150 square feet. The inmates have no equipment when they
occupy these yards. These yards are not used to storage of any materials or equipment and there no electrical devices or
outlets accessible to the inmates. The California Building Code does not address the minimum requirements for these
exercise yards. Typically, these yards are located adjacent to 270 housing units, away from the general population
exercise yards.

The occupancy for covered exercise yards is |-3, as any other building within the institution where inmates are confined.
The construction type is Type I-B, with all materials being non-combustible, as follows:

e  Structure: steel posts or steel tubes

e Wall materials: steel plate or steel crimp-lock welded wire mesh

e Fire proofing of these materials is not required.

Fire alarms and sprinklers should not be required provided the yards are a minimum of 10 feet away from all buildings,
structures or fences, and the yard covering does not exceed 50% of the fenced enclosure.

Officers in charge of yards shall have personal alarms and radios to notify central control in case of fire.

Each yard is to provide exercise for a maximum of two inmates at a time. Exercise yards are 10 foot by 15 foot with a
design minimum of 75 square feet per inmate.

414.5

Office of the State Fire Marshal 10 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



414.5.7

The SFM is proposing these amendments for the handling and transportation of hazardous materials for all occupancies.
These amendments were developed by the Group L task group. This task group was made up of representatives from fire
service (Nor-Cal and So-Cal BO'’s, biotech industry, consultants, CALBO, architect, University of California and SFM staff.)
The task group held regular monthly meetings and numerous task groups. These amendments represent a consensus of
the task group which include the handling and transportation of hazardous materials above the 10" story and in elevators
of all occupancies.

The task group concluded that the requirements for the handling and transportation of hazardous materials above the 10"
story should also be applied to all occupancies. The determination to increase the requirements for the handling and
transportation of hazardous materials above the 10" story and in elevators of all occupancies, was based upon safety
practices regarding hazardous material incidents in buildings.

415.9

4159.1

4159.1.1

415.9.1.2

415.9.1.3

4159.1.4

415.9.15

415.10

415.10.1

415.10.2

415.10.3

The SFM is proposing these amendments to the Group H occupancies to limit the maximum height to 20 stories. These
amendments were developed by the Group L task group. These proposed amendments for the Group H occupancies are
the same as the proposed requirements for a Group L occupancy above the 10" story.

The SFM and the SFM Group L task group agree that the same requirements for a Group L occupancy above the 0™
story should be applied to Group H occupancies as well, due to the similar hazardous environment. SFM is only
addressing the Group H occupancies above the 10" story at this time, due to the complexity of these occupancies.

This task group was made up of representatives from fire service (Nor-Cal and So-Cal BO'’s, biotech industry, consultants,
CALBO, architect, University of California and SFM staff.) The task group held regular monthly meetings and numerous
task groups.

These amendments represent a consensus of the task group which include the maximum height of Group H occupancies
and the maximum quantity of laboratory suites. These proposed amendments also include provisions for the
transportation and handling of hazardous materials.

The task group felt that the requirements for the Group L occupancy above the 10" story should also be apPIied to all
Group H occupancies as well. In addition, the handling and transportation of hazardous materials above the 10 " floor and
in elevators should be applied to all occupancies not just Group L and H occupancies.

The requirements for Group H occupancies above the 10" story include: two hour fire barrier/smoke barrier wall with an
elevator lobby on each side, increased fire alarm requirements with specified zoning, maximum height of Group L
occupancies, maximum number of laboratory suites and the maximum quantity of hazardous materials allowed.

The determination to limit the height and location of the Group H occupancies to buildings less than 20 stories was based
upon the fire service response to hazardous material incidents in high rise buildings, versus the financial concerns and
laboratory operations of the bio-tech industry. It was agreed by consensus that the Group H occupancies above the 10"
floor should have increased fire and life safety requirements. The proposed two-hour fire barrier/smoke barrier and
elevators within elevator lobbies located on either side would then allow a reasonably safe fire service response to
hazardous material incidents on those floors.

420

420.1

419.5420.5

419:6-420.6

The SFM is proposing modification of the I-1 occupancy classification to R-2.1 to correlate with the modifications proposed to

Office of the State Fire Marshal 11 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Section 308.2 and 310.1 that reclassify Group I-1 to that of R-2.1. Additional revisions proposed renumber these sections
due to revisions made to the IBC numbering sequence. There is no change in regulatory effect.

425 through 425.10
Except as identified herein, the above Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.

The SFM is proposing modification of the I-1 occupancy classification to R-2.1 to correlate with the modifications proposed to
Section 308.2 and 310.1 that reclassify Group I-1 to that of R-2.1.

The SFM is proposing to add Section 425.5.3 for independent egress to correlate with existing provisions for smoke
compartments. These provisions are currently contained in Section 407.4.2 for | occupancies, however, such are missing
from the provisions for the proposed R-2.1 occupancies. Additional revisions proposed renumber these sections due to
revisions made to the IBC numbering sequence. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM is proposing clarifying language to section 425.8.3.2 regarding door size and clear opening width for direct exit to the
exterior from bedroom containing nonambulatory clients. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM proposes modifications to 425.8.3.3 to clarify the intent that provisions 1 through 5 only apply when there is one
bedridden client and the facility is not protected with an automatic sprinkler system. These provisions do not apply where the
facility houses two or more bedridden clients or nonambulatory clients as such would be required to have automatic sprinkler
protection and comply with 425.8.3.2. Additional clarifying language is proposed in the form of a note that permits the use
of a sliding glass door may be used for the door requirements contained in item 5. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM is proposing to clarify where ramps are required pursuant to Section 425.8.5. Over the past several years the issue
of mandating ramps on the exterior of Group R-3.1 occupancies has been a concern for fire and building code officials.
The SFM has posted several code interpretations on this issue (00-019 & 02-025) and most recently the question arose
regarding the 2007 California Building Code. During the rulemaking process to create the 2007 California Building Code,
the SFM had not revised the intent for changes in level in Group R-3.1 occupancies (Section 425.8.5), and further does
not require changes in level for the exterior to be made by means of a ramp. Re-searching back to previous editions of the
CBC, the language has remained the same, and the intent remains the same; in that, it is not the responsibility of the local
fire official to enforce exterior exit ramps as these code sections apply to the interior changes of level in the facility only.
This amendment does not preclude other provisions of the CBC relating to accessibility that may require exterior ramps in
accordance with Chapters 11A or 11B .

426 ,426.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
proposed modifications are correlated with Section 442.4 for kindergarten, first- and second-grade children or for day-care
purposes, see purpose and rational for 442.4 for additional information. There is no change in regulatory effect.

442 through 442.5.1
Except as identified herein, the above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought
forward without modification. There is no change in regulatory effect.

Section 442.2 is modified to clarify the intent of this section and eliminate unnecessary fire partitions or fire rated walls or
horizontal assemblies. The intent of this section is to provide “atmospheric” separation of exit ways. Adding the language
as noted will be more specific and make the intent evident. Text added for smoke barriers is consistent with the SFM
provisions contained in the 2001 CBC that were brought forward into the 2007 CBC.

Section 442.4 is modified to address school facilities located above the first floor. Many elementary school campuses
desire to locate Libraries and other facilities on the second floor. The library and other facilities also serve as assembly
areas or Multi-purpose rooms. Some are large enough to accommodate the entire population of the campus, while others
“rotate” the students from various grades to accomplish their program(s). In both cases the students from the K-2 can co-
mingle with the other larger children during the process.

The intent of this section is to prohibit the mixing of the small, less agile students, with the larger, more coordinated,
students, thus eliminating the risk of smaller children being trampled by the older ones in a panic situation. The K-2
children should be limited to grade level or segregated from the older children when above or below grade.

Students/occupants incapable of self preservation or responding to an emergency situation, such as those that are
autistic, nonambulatory, have reduced visual acuity, or have other impairments, need additional time to evacuate.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 12 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Negotiating stairs, either up to or down, to grade hinders their ability to evacuate the building in a timely manner.
Requiring occupants that are not capable of responding to an emergency situation without physical assistance_to be at
grade level affords the additional time needed for evacuation and increases their survivability in an emergency situation.

The addition of “or other approved egress systems complying with CBC 1017 with two exits.” is intended to reduce the
confusion associated with the current language. CBC Section 1017 addresses the use of “corridors”. Many Architects,
Design Professionals, and Plan Reviewers are confused about the intent of CBC 442.4 with regard to exiting. They believe
this section requires exit balconies to accommodate K-2 classrooms on the second floor. Some Primary Schools serve
only K-2 students, and the design limitation of providing two exterior exits is impractical. Allowing a central corridor with
two exits serving a number of classrooms for K-2 students on the second floor is more conducive to the intent of this
section. Further modification to item 3.5 reinstates the provisions of the 2001 CBC and intent. Language for separate
means of egress system is included from 1007.3 to complete the requirement as such is currently missing. There is no
change in regulatory effect.

443 through 443.8
The SFM is proposing these amendments to the group L occupancies to limit the number of laboratory suites and the
quantity of hazardous materials based upon the height of the of Group L bldg.

These amendments are a direct result of the building standards commission (BSC) recommendation to the SFM. As
requested by the BSC, SFM created a task group to review existing Group L requirements limited the number of laboratory
suites based on building height.

This task group was made up of representatives from fire service (Nor-Cal and So-Cal BO’s, biotech industry, consultants,
CALBO, architect, University of California and SFM staff.) The task group held regular monthly meetings and numerous
task groups.

These amendments represent a consensus of the task group which include the maximum height of Group L occupancies
and the maximum quantity of laboratory suites. These proposed amendments also include provisions for the
transportation and handling of hazardous materials.

The task group felt that the requirements for the Group L occupancy above the 10" story should also be applied to all
Group H occupancies as well, due to the similarities of the occupancies. The task group also felt that the handling and
transportation of hazardous materials above the 10" story and in elevators should be applied to all occupancies not just
Group L and H occupancies.

The requirements for Group L occupancies above the 10" story include: two hour fire barrier/smoke barrier wall with an
elevator lobby on each side, increased fire alarm requirements with specified zoning, maximum height of Group L
occupancies, maximum number of laboratory suites and the maximum quantity of hazardous materials allowed.

The determination to limit the height and location of the Group L occupancies to buildings less than 20 stories was based
upon the fire service response to hazardous material incidents in high rise buildings, versus the financial concerns and
laboratory operations of the bio-tech industry. It was agreed by consensus that the Group L occupancies above the 10"
story, would be allowed with the increased fire and life safety requirements. The proposed two-hour fire barrier/smoke
barrier and elevators within elevator lobbies located on either side would then allow a reasonably safe fire service
response to hazardous material incidents on those stories.

445.5
Section 445.5 is being repealed as these provisions are duplicated in Section 907.2.6.4 currently; SFM proposes to add a
reference 907.2.6.4.

445.8
Section 445.8 is being repealed as these provisions are duplicated in Section 1015.7 currently; SFM proposes to add a
reference 1015.7.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 13 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



(5]

CHAPTER 5
GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 5 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 5 without modification. The SFM
is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

Table 503

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
above Table as amended containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. There is no change in
regulatory effect. Editorial revisions are proposed to correct the section reference for restraint provisions.

The SFM Proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310. Group I-1 occupancies
are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than
6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification
and relocation. This proposed reclassification will resolve both and have no change in regulatory effect. For additional
information see the purpose and rational for modifications made to Section 308.2 and 310.1 R-21

Additional modifications proposed to Group H and L occupancies are correlated with the modifications to Section 443. See
Section 443 for the purpose and rational.

Furthermore the SFM proposes to add footnotes g and h to correlate the statutory provisions of Health and Safety Code
13131.5 as it relates to nonambulatory persons.

504.2

506.3

The above Sections as amended or containing California regulations are brought forward with editorial modifications. The
SFM proposes to move the term high-rise after the occupancy group classifications to assist the user and avoid
misapplication of the provisions. Additional text is proposed to be revised is to correlate with new or revised style and
format of the IBC. There is no change in regulatory effect.

506.4.1

The above Section as amended or containing California regulations are brought forward with editorial modifications. The
SFM proposes to move the term high-rise after the occupancy group classifications to assist the user and avoid
misapplication of the provisions. Additional text is proposed to be revised is to correlate with new or revised style and
format of the IBC. There is no change in regulatory effect.

506.5.2

The above Sections as amended or containing California regulations are brought forward from 506.4.1 to 506.5.2 with
editorial modifications. The SFM proposes to move the term high-rise after the occupancy group classifications to assist
the user and avoid misapplication of the provisions. Additional text is proposed to be revised is to correlate with new or
revised style and format of the IBC. There is no change in regulatory effect.

508.2.4

508.3.3

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
SFM Proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310 R-2.1. Group I-1 occupancies
are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than
6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification
and relocation. This proposed reclassification will resolve both and have no change in regulatory effect. For additional
information see the purpose and rational for modifications made to Section 308.2 and 310.1 R-2.1. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the

Office of the State Fire Marshal 14 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

Table 508.4

The above Table as amended containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The SFM Proposes
to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310 R-2.1. Group I-1 occupancies are proposed
to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than 6 clients. The
California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification and relocation.
This proposed reclassification will resolve both and have no change in regulatory effect. For additional information see the
purpose and rational for modifications made to Section 308.2 and 310.1 R-2.1. There is no change in regulatory effect.

Additional modifications proposed resolve several issues. First, it relocates the Group I-3 occupancies to separate cells as
the Group I-2 occupancies. Second, it requires that the Group I-1 and Group -4 occupancies be separated from each
other with a minimum 1-hour fire-resistance rating. It also clarifies the table regarding the Group | occupancies for the NS
columns where some of the individual cell entries have been changed to “NP.” This recognizes the fact that the entire
building containing a Group | occupancy is required to be protected with an automatic sprinkler system throughout even
where there are other mixed occupancies that may be separated with fire barriers or horizontal assemblies.

The SFM contends that the Group I-3 occupancy should be treated the same as the Group I-2 occupancy when the
separated occupancies option of Section 508.4 is used since they have similar relative hazards. This is also consistent
with the 2009 NFPA 101 Life Safety Code which requires a minimum 2-hour fire-resistance rating for all occupancy
separations involving detention and correctional facilities as specified in Tables 6.1.14.4.1(a) and (b) Required Separation
of Occupancies (hours), Part 1 and Part 2. This is also necessary to implement the intent of the State Fire Marshal
amendment to the 2007 California Building Code (CBC) Section 508.3.2.3 Separation (2006 International Building (IBC))
for the Exception which requires Group I-3 occupancies to be separated from all other occupancies in accordance with
Section 508.3.3 Separated Occupancies (2006 IBC). The separated occupancies option section, which is now Section
508.4 in the 2009 IBC, refers to Table 508.4 Required Separation of Occupancies (hours) for determining the fire-
resistance rating of the occupancy separation depending upon the occupancies being separated. However, the way the
table currently is structured, a Group I-3 occupancy would not be required to be separated from a Group I-1 or I-4
occupancy.

We have also included the Group I-2.1 occupancy classification (a current State Fire Marshal amendment) within the
same cells as the Group I-2 occupancy of which it is a subset.

As indicated previously, this amendment will also require that a Group I-1 occupancy be separated from a Group |-4
occupancy with a minimum 1-hour fire-resistance rated separation. This would be consistent with Table 508.4 in the 2009
IBC which requires these occupancies to be separated from Group R occupancies with an minimum 1-hour fire-resistance
rating. And Footnote e has been added to the 1-hour rating for the I-1/1-4 occupancies to indicate that where the
occupancy classification is the same, then there is no separation required. In other words, this would not require, as is
currently the case, an occupancy separation for a Group I-1 occupancy and an adjacent Group I-1 occupancy in the same
building, or similarly for a Group I-4 occupancy adjacent to another Group I-4 occupancy in the same building. Also, a
footnote has been added for the Group I-2 and I-3 occupancies for the same reason.

And, finally, for the Group I-1 occupancies, this amendment is consistent with Exception 3 of Section 508.2.4 Separation
of Occupancies and Exception 2 of Section 508.3.3 Separation in the 2009 IBC.

In conclusion, this amendment will clarify where the required occupancy separations are to be provided under the
separated occupancies option of the 2009 IBC for all Group | occupancies and makes the code internally consistent, as
well as consistent with current State Fire Marshal amendments.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

509.2

509.9-509.10

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
SFM Proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310 R-2.1. Group I-1 occupancies

Office of the State Fire Marshal 15 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than
6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification
and relocation. This proposed reclassification will resolve both and have no change in regulatory effect. For additional
information see the purpose and rational for modifications made to Section 308.2 and 310.1 R-2.1. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

(6]

CHAPTER 6
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 6 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 6 without modification. The SFM
is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

Table 601

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
SFM Proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310 R-2.1. Group I-1 occupancies
are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than
6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification
and relocation. This proposed reclassification will resolve both and have no change in regulatory effect. For additional
information see the purpose and rational for modifications made to Section 308.2 and 310.1 R-2.1. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

The SFM further proposes to move the term high-rise after the occupancy group classifications to assist the user and
avoid misapplication of the provisions. Additional text is proposed to be revised is to correlate with new or revised style
and format of the IBC. There is no change in regulatory effect.

Table 602
The above Sections as amended or containing California regulations are brought forward with editorial modifications to
correct the footnote as a result of new IBC footnotes. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM received a petition for regulation change for the reduction in building setback to property lines for building
equipped with automatic fire sprinkler systems. The SFM has also received similar proposals that are being proposed to
the IRC in the 2009/2010 ICC code cycle which reduce building setback to property lines for building equipped with
automatic fire sprinkler systems. The petitioner requests that dwellings protected with automatic fire sprinkler systems be
permitted to be constructed to within three feet of the property line without additional fire-resistive exterior wall construction
or limitations on openings.

The SFM has reviewed the justification provided by in the petition for change, including additional information provided
from proposals to the IRC in the 2009/2010 ICC code cycle. The SFM concurs with the petitioner and has proposed
modification to the above Sections and Tables for building setbacks. Furthermore, the SFM concurs with the supporting
information developed by the Joint Fire Services Review Committee in their efforts to modify the IRC.

The SFM is proposing these modifications to reduce building setback from five to three feet for exterior wall fire-resistive
ratings where building are provided with automatic sprinkler protection. The SFM considers these modifications
reasonable while maintaining a minimum level of fire safety. The SFM not only basis protection on efforts in fire and life
safety but must also include economic value. The addition of residential sprinkler protection affords the SFM to consider
other means or reductions that may offset costs. Additionally these proposed modification offer an incentive to install
residential sprinkler protection in non sprinklered dwellings to achieve a reduced setback.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 16 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



The following justifications and additional information was provided by the petitioner which complete the SFM rational for
the proposed modifications:

1. Lack of justification for national provision: Until very recently, the Department of Housing and Community
Development (HCD) used the provisions of the Uniform Building Code (UBC), published by the International Conference
of Building Officials (ICBO), as the national basis for California’s residential building standards. For at least eighty (80)
years (see 1927 UBC, Section 1403; page 48), the UBC allowed walls and openings in R-3 occupancies (One-and Two-
Family Dwellings) to be constructed no less than three feet from the property line.

When HCD switched over to the 2006 International Building Code (IBC), the Department modified that portion of the IBC
relative to R-3 walls and openings to be consistent with the 2006 edition of the International Residential Code. This
resulted in a change to the longstanding minimum separation distance of “3 feet” to “5 feet”. However, investigation of the
history of this IRC provision has yet to find any substantial justification explaining why the “5 foot” dimension was
incorporated into the 2006 IRC.

More importantly, the 2009 Edition of the International Residential Code contains a newly adopted mandate for residential
fire sprinkler systems in all new R-3 occupancies. It should be pointed out that an automatic fire sprinkler system, installed
in accordance with an NFPA-13D fire sprinkler system will be “expected to prevent flashover (total involvement) in the
room of fire origin”. Given this significant increase in the fire safety provisions of R-3 construction, coupled with the
historical fact that California dwellings had already been performing well under the three foot property-line separation for
many decades, there is simply no justification to continue to maintain the 5-foot property line separation as specified in the
2009 IRC.

2. This proposal is consistent with HCD’s effort to promote “Green Building” in R-3 construction: Simply put, the
change to a 5-foot property-line separation caught many in the industry and local government by surprise. In recent years,
local jurisdictions, the environmental community and industry have been investigating ways to increase housing density
while continuing to maintain health and life safety. Given the fact that the longstanding 3-foot separation distance had
worked so well in California (and for so long); it was difficult to understand why such a change had been made at the
national level. Clearly, the most common type of housing construction in California is “production-style housing” where
new residential communities are planned and constructed in “phases” consisting of 8-16 homes at a time. An additional
four (4) feet per lot [(5- 3') x 2 side-yards = 4'] of buildable area is significant when you consider that it may well allow for
1-2 additional homes per project. This offers the ability for a more resource-efficient planning and land-use design and is
very consistent with HCD’s recent adoption of the nations first set of statewide residential green building standards.

Reference to the authority of the state agency to take the rulemaking action requested.
SFM: Health and Safety Code Sections 13143, et al and 17921(b)
HCD: State Housing Law; Health and Safety Code Section 17921, et al.

3. Additional information provided by the Joint Fire Services Review Committee via the petitioner regarding
similar proposals for the 2009/2010 ICC code cycle to revise the IRC. In the last code cycle, Proposal RB67-07/08
(which was withdrawn at the Final Action Hearings) provided as one of its sprinkler alternatives a reduction in exterior wall
fire ratings that we believe still is a reasonable and justifiable sprinkler incentive. This proposal will provide a reasonable
sprinkler alternative in the IRC when residential sprinkler systems are installed.

This proposal provides a significant financial and design incentive for residential sprinklers. From a financial perspective,
the proposal permits cost reductions related to exterior wall construction and, in the case of a planned community, could
result in more developable lots. From a design advantage perspective, the proposal permits homes to have larger
footprints without triggering fire-rated exterior walls and permits more flexible use of windows on walls facing property
lines.

From a fire safety perspective, the proposed requirements under new Table R302.1(2) generally put the code back where
it was in 2000 and 2003, so there is essentially no concession compared to how homes have been built under the IRC
since the code was first published in 2000. In 2006, the IRC'’s fire separation distances for non-rated exterior walls were
increased from 3 feet to 5 feet for the purpose of coordinating the IRC’s residential separation distances with those in the
IBC (Code Change G128-03/04). History shows that residential sprinklers reliably limit fire spread to the room of origin,
and with such protection, allowing the code to revert to a 3-foot separation distance provides a reasonable compensation
for sprinklers. Certainly, the probability of a favorable outcome in the event of a fire is much better for a sprinklered
building with a 3-foot separation versus a nonsprinklered building with a 5-foot separation, so encouraging sprinklers is a
preferred approach.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 17 of 58 June 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



The proposed garage requirement for R309.7 provides a limitation on the application of new Table R302.1(2) by only
allowing use of sprinkler incentives in areas where sprinklers are provided. Normally, garages aren’t required to have
sprinklers; however, where a designer chooses to take advantage of reduced separation requirements for a garage wall, it
is appropriate for the garage to be provided with sprinklers as a means of property protection. Proposed design criteria for
sprinklers were derived from NFPA 13R Section 6.8.3.3, which addresses sprinkler protection for garages in buildings
protected by NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Often, garage protection is provided by dry pendent or dry sidewall sprinklers
connected to a wet pipe sprinkler system.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

[7]

CHAPTER 7
FIRE-RESISTANCE-RATED CONSTRUCTION

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 7 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 7 without modification. The SFM
is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

702.1 Definitions

FIRE-SMOKE BARRIER

The SFM is proposing this new definition to correlate with modifications for H and L occupancies located above the 10" story.
New provisions proposed for H and L occupancies located above the 10" floor require separation consisting of a 2-hour fire
barrier while utilizing the air leakage containment provisions of smoke barriers. For additional information 