INITIAL STATEMENT OF REASONS
FOR
PROPOSED BUILDING STANDARDS
OF THE
OFFICE OF THE STATE FIRE MARSHAL (SFM)
REGARDING THE ADOPTION BY REFERENCE OF THE
2009 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (IBC)
WITH AMENDMENTS INTO THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE (CBC)
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 2

The Administrative Procedure Act requires that an Initial Statement of Reasons be available to the public upon request
when rulemaking action is being undertaken. The following are the reasons for proposing this particular rulemaking
action:

STATEMENT OF SPECIFIC PURPOSE AND RATIONALE
(Government Code Section 11346.2)

The specific purpose of this rulemaking effort by the Office of the State Fire Marshal is to act accordance with Health and
Safety Code section 18928, which requires all proposed regulations to specifically comply with this section in regards to
the adoption by reference with amendments to a model code within one year after its publication.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and be published as the 2010
California Building Code.

The general purpose of this proposed action is principally intended to update and codify a new edition of the California
Building Code (California Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 2) based upon a more current edition of a model code. The
current California Building Code in effect is the 2007 California Building Code which is based upon the 2006 International
Building Code of the International Code Council. This proposed action:

o Repeal the adoption by reference of the 2006 International Building Code of the International Code Council
and incorporate and adopt by reference in its place the 2009 International Building Code of the International
Code Council for application and effectiveness in the 2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and
Safety Code 18928. Health and Safety Code 18928 requires any state agency adopting model codes to adopt
the most recent edition.

e Repeal certain amendments to the 2006 International Building Code and/or California Building Standards not
addressed by the model code that are no longer necessary pursuant with Health and Safety Code
18930(a)(7)..

e  Adopt new building standards or necessary amendments to the 2009 International Building Code that address
inadequacies of the 2009 International Building Code as they pertain to California laws.

e  Bring forward previously existing California building standards or amendments, which represent no change in
their effect from the 2007 California Building Standards Code.

e Codify non-substantive editorial and formatting amendments from the format based upon the 2006
International Building Code to the format of the 2009 International Building Code.

The specific purpose and rationale of each adoption, amendment, or repeal is as follows:

Office of the State Fire Marshal 1 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



[1]

CHAPTER 1
DIVISION I
CALIFORNIA GENERAL CODE PROVISIONS

The SFM propose to create two Divisions within Chapter 1 for existing administrative provisions being brought forward and
administrative provisions contained in the 2009 IBC. The creation of two divisions is a result of and direction made by the
California Building Standards Commissions, Code Coordinating Council and Stakeholder discussions regarding relocating
the base model code administrative provisions from an appendix to Chapter 1 of the code. The SFM proposes to
distinguish the California Chapter 1 administrative provisions from those of the base model code Chapter 1 administrative
provisions by renumbering the California administrative sections.

Sections 1.1 -1.1.12

The SFM is proposing to maintain the adoption of those existing California regulations contained Sections 1.1 through
1.1.12 with modification.

The SFM proposes to update the IBC reference from 2006 to 2009, and to make changes to provide consistency with
other Parts of Title 24, administrative provisions. The SFM proposes to make nonsubstantive reference, grammatical, and
punctuation corrections to Sections 1.1 through 1.1.12 for consistency with the Chapter 1, General Code Provisions of
Title 24, Parts 2, 3, 4, 5, and 9. The SFM proposes modifications to 1.1.5 to further clarify that the National Fire Code also
include the National Fire Code Standards by adding the term “standards”. The SFM proposes modifications to Section
1.1.8.1 are proposed to revise the mailing address for the Department of Housing and Community Developments (HCD)
from a physical address to a post office box for mailings of findings to be filed with HCD. The SFM proposes modifications
to clarify in Section 1.1.10 that complete copies of specified California Code of Regulations Titles are required to be
maintained at the building official's office. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

1.1.7.4

1.1.13

1.1.14

The SFM proposes to incorporate into the California General Code Provisions certain administrative provisions derived
from the Building, Fire and Residential Code. These administrative provisions are proposed to be relocated from the
proposed Division Il of Chapter 1 of such codes as they are typically note adopted by SFM in the base model code.
Relocating these provisions to Division | of the California General Code Provisions will provide statewide application and
consistency. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

[1.1]
Sections 1.11-111.10

The SFM is proposing to maintain the adoption of those existing California regulations contained Sections 1.11 through
1.11.10 with modification.

SFM proposes to make nonsubstantive reference, grammatical, and punctuation corrections to Sections 1.11 through
1.11.10 for consistency with the Chapter 1, General Code Provisions of Title 24, Parts 2, 3, 4, 5, and 9. SFM proposes
modifications to 1.11.1 to further clarify the authority and reference for applications regulated by the SFM. SFM proposes
modifications to clarify in Section 1.11.2.1.2 enforcement responsibilities for state owned buildings, state occupied
buildings, and state institutions. SFM proposes modifications to remove obsolete language and terminology from Section
1.11.3.1 for public school plans and specifications and annual submission. These amendments do not create a change in
regulatory effect.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 2 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

[1.2]

CHAPTER 1
DIVISION li

The SFM proposes the Division Il designation for the IBC Chapter 1 Administrative provisions - Sections 101 through 114.

The SFM proposes to adopt specific Sections of Chapter 1, Division Il with the amendment and California regulation. The
SFM proposes to adopt only those Sections listed in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

The SFM proposes to remove specific Sections contained in section 101 and 102 of the IBC that are duplicative of the
California Administrative provisions in Section 1.1. The IBC Sections proposed for deletion and the corresponding
California Sections are shown as follows:

IBC Section to be removed Corresponding California Sections
101.1 1.11
101.2 1.1.3
101.2.1 1.1.4
101.3 1.1.2
101.4 1.15and 1.1.3.1
101.4.1 1.15and 1.1.3.1
101.4.2 1.15and 1.1.3.1
101.4.3 1.15and 1.1.3.1
101.4.4 1.15and 1.1.3.1
101.4.5 1.15and 1.1.3.1
101.4.6 1.15and 1.1.3.1
102.1 1.1.7.3
102.2 1.1.12
102.4 1.1.5
102.3
102.5
102.6

The SFM proposes to incorporate the above Sections into the California General Code Provisions. These administrative
provisions are proposed to be relocated from the proposed Division Il of Chapter 1 of such codes as they are typically note
adopted by SFM in the base model code. Relocating these provisions to Division | of the California General Code
Provisions will provide statewide application and consistency. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory
effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

(2]

Office of the State Fire Marshal 3 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



CHAPTER 2
DEFINITIONS

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 2 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore, the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California definitions or model code definitions as amended in Chapter 2 without
modification. The SFM is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix
Adoption Table pursuant to Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and
18949.2.

201.3
201.4
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.

Section 202 Definitions.

AGED HOME OR INSTITUTION

BEDRIDDEN PERSON

BUILDING

CARE AND SUPERVISION

CATASTROPHICALLY INJURED

CHILD-CARE CENTER

The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

CELL

The SFM is proposing to remove the section reference in the definition of “cell” due to revisions made to the IBC that
revised provisions for Group I-3 occupancies making the SFM amendment no longer necessary. These amendments do
not create a change in regulatory effect.

CHILD OR CHILDREN
CHRONICALLY ILL
The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

CONGREGATE LIVING FACILITIES
The SFM proposes remove the above IBC definition to eliminate conflict with California licensed facilities classified by
statute as further defined in the CBC. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

CONGREGATE LIVING HEALTH FACILITY (CLHF)

CONGREGATE RESIDENCE.

DAYCARE

DAY-CARE HOME, LARGE FAMILY

DAY-CAREHOME, SMALL FAMILY

The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

DORMIROTY
The SFM is proposing to revise the section reference in the definition of “dormitory” due to revisions made to the IBC that
revised provisions for Group I-3 occupancies. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE

ENFORCING AGENCY

FIRE-RETARDANT TREATED WOOD

FULL-TIME CARE

HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCE

The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

HIGH-RISE BUILDING
The SFM is proposing to remove IBC language defining “High-rise Buildings” that conflicts with the statutory provisions of

Office of the State Fire Marshal 4 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Health and Safety Code 13210 and that are further defined in CBC Section 403.1.3. These amendments do not create a
change in regulatory effect.

INFANT

LABORATORY

LABORATORY SUITE

LISTED

LOBBY

MENTALLY RETARDED PERSONS, PROFOUNDLY OR SEVERELY

MODERNIZATION PROJECT

MOTION PICTURE AND TELEVISION PRODUCTION STUDIO SOUND STAGES, APPROVED PRODUCTION
FACILITIES AND PRODUCTION LOCATIONS

NEW PUBLIC SCHOOL CAMPUS

NONAMBULATORY PERSONS

NONCOMBUSTIBLE

ORGANIZED CAMPS

PERMANENT PORTABLE BUILDING

PERSONAL-CARE-SERMICE

The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

PHOTOLUMINESCENT

The SFM is proposing to repeal the current California definition of “photoluminescent” due to revisions made to the IBC
that that now defines “photoluminescent” making the California definition no longer necessary. These amendments do not
create a change in regulatory effect.

PORTABLE BUILDING

The SFM is proposing to further clarify the definition of “Portable Building”. Such portable buildings may be classified as
other than Group E yet are subject to the provisions for public schools when housing or serving students from kindergarten
through twelfth grade and funded pursuant to the California Education Code commencing with Section 17070.10. These
amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

PORTABLE BUILDING, EXEMPTED

The SFM is relocating provisions contained in 907.2.3.8.3 that define “Exempt Portable Buildings” to chapter 2 definitions,
which are correlated with the existing definition or “Portable Building” as they relate to school facilities. This modification
has no change in regulatory effect.

PROTECTIVE SOCIAL CARE
The above definition as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

RESIBENHAL-CARE/ASSISTED-LMINGFACILIHES
The SFM proposes remove the above IBC definition to eliminate conflict with California licensed facilities classified by
statute as further defined in the CBC. These amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

RESIDENTIAL CARE FACILITY FOR THE CHRONICALLY ILL (RCF/CI)

RESIDENTIAL CARE FACILITY FOR THE ELDERLY (RCFE)

RESIDENTIAL FACILITY (RF)

The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

RESTRAINT

The SFM is proposing to revise the occupancy classification in the definition of “restraint” to coordinate with modifications
proposed that reclassify Group I-1 to Group R-2.1 occupancies in this rulemaking. The SFM is also proposing to revise
the section reference due to revisions made to the IBC that revised provisions for Group [-3 occupancies. These
amendments do not create a change in regulatory effect.

SELF-LUMINOUS

The SFM is proposing to repeal the current California definition of “self-luminous” due to revisions made to the IBC that
that now defines “self-luminous” making the California definition no longer necessary. These amendments do not create a
change in regulatory effect.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 5 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



STATE-OWNED/LEASED BUILDING

TERMINALLY ILL

WAITING ROOM

WINERY CAVES.

The above definitions as amended or California definitions are brought forward without modification.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property
against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

(3]

CHAPTER 3
BUILDING PLANNING

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 3 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 3 without modification. The SFM
is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

302.1

The SFM is including Group R-2.1 occupancy classification to the residential occupancy classification due to the occupancy
reclassification of I-1 occupancies. See the purpose and rational for Section 310.1 for additional information. There is no
change in regulatory effect.

303.1

303.2

303.3

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

304.1

The SFM is proposing to modify this new IBC occupancy to correlate with existing SFM provisions for Group I-2.1 Ambulatory
Care Facilities in Section 308.3.2. The SFM proposes to repeal reference to Group 1-2.1 occupancies for clinics as a
result of the new IBC provisions for ambulatory health care facilities. Furthermore the above amended Sections as
amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

305.1
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

305.2

The SFM is making additional editorial revisions to correct the age limitation derived from thee statutory definition of infant,
to correlate existing SFM and Department of Social Services, Community Care Licensing Division Title 22 regulations and
terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC.

306.2

307.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Editorial revision made to correct item 16 as renumbered to item 14 due to the renumbering of the model code section.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

Table 307.1(1) footnote d
Table 307.1(2) footnote e
307.1.1

Office of the State Fire Marshal 6 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



The above amended Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without
modification. There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.1

The above Section as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Editorial revisions is made to correct the section reference due to the restructuring of the model code provisions. There is
no change in regulatory effect.

308.2

The SFM proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies to Section 310. Group I-1 occupancies
are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1 occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than
6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification
and relocation.

During the promulgation of the 2007 California Codes the SFM sought to utilize the base model code provisions as much as
possible. The SFM consolidated the existing Residential Care Facilities that were classified as Group R-2.1, R-2.3 and R-6.1
into that of the group I-1 occupancy classification. The consolidation of these occupancies into one has lessened confusion and
has made for consistent design, enforcement and use. However, classification of Group I-1 for these residential in nature type
facilities has been problematic for designers, providers and enforcing agencies. Such problems as which disabled access
provisions apply and zoning for residential Vs institutional are of the greatest concern. This proposed reclassification will resolve
both and have no change in regulatory effect.

308.3

308.3.1 Definitions

CHILD CARE FACILITIES

DETOXIFICATION FACILITIES

HOSPITALS AND MENTAL HOSPITALS

NURSING HOMES

Except as identified herein, the above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought
forward with modification. Existing statutory and regulatory provisions for non-ambulatory and bedridden are proposed
replacing the IBC language not that is inconsistence.

The SFM is proposing modification to include statutory provisions that limit the number of clients or children that may be
housed in a child care facility and nursing homes. These limitations are also coordinated with other occupancy
classifications that set a minimum and/or maximum number of clients, including Groups 1-2, I-4, R-2.1, R-3.1 and R-4
occupancies. The SFM is making additional editorial revisions to correct the age limitation derived from thee statutory
definition of infant, to correlate existing SFM and Department of Social Services, Community Care Licensing Division Title
22 regulations and terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC.

308.3.2
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.4
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.3.2

308.4

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 7 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



RESTRAINT

The SFM is proposing to relocated the definitions contained in Section 308.4.6 to 408.1.1 which will coincide with revisions
made to the model code restructuring. See purpose and rational statement for 408.1.1 for additional information. There is
no change in regulatory effect.

308.5

Except as identified herein, the above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought
forward without modification. The SFM is making additional editorial revisions to coincide with other existing California
regulations and terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC. Additional modifications proposed reinstate the model
code provisions previously removed that reference to the International Residential code with modification to reference the
California Residential Code. There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.5.1
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.5.2

The above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought forward without modification. The
SFM is making additional editorial revisions to correct the age limitation derived from thee statutory definition of infant, to
correlate existing SFM and Department of Social Services, Community Care Licensing Division Title 22 regulations and
terms used for care facilities throughout the CBC.

There is no change in regulatory effect.

308.5.2.1
The above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

(310.1)

The SFM modifications proposed reinstate the model code provisions previously removed that reference to the
International Residential code with modification to reference the California Residential Code. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

(310.2)

R-2.1

The SFM Proposes to reclassify and relocate the provisions for Group I-1 occupancies from section 308.2 to Section 310 under
the Group R-2.1 occupancy classification. Group I-1 occupancies are proposed to be reclassified to reinstate the R-2.1
occupancy classification for Residential Care Facilities housing more than 6 clients. The California statutory provisions, existing
regulations being brought forward are not affected by the reclassification and relocation.

During the promulgation of the 2007 California Codes the SFM sought to utilize the base model code provisions as much as
possible. The SFM consolidated the existing Residential Care Facilities that were classified as Group R-2.1, R-2.3 and R-6.1
into that of the group I-1 occupancy classification. The consolidation of these occupancies into one has lessened confusion and
has made for consistent design, enforcement and use. However, classification of Group I-1 for these residential in nature type
facilities has been problematic for designers, providers and enforcing agencies. Such problems as which disabled access
provisions apply and zoning for residential Vs institutional are of the greatest concern. This proposed reclassification will resolve
both and have no change in regulatory effect.

(310.1)

R-3

The SFM is proposing to include Group R-2.1 occupancies for clarity to be listed with other occupancies when classifying
a Group R-3 (see additional purpose and rational for Group R-2.1 occupancies below).

The SFM is proposing to reinstate model code provisions with modification, and include statutory provisions that limit the
number of clients or children that may be housed in a Group R-3 used for day care purposes. These limitations are also
coordinated with other occupancy classifications that set a minimum and/or maximum number of clients, including Groups
I-2, 1-4, R-2.1, R-3.1 and R-4 occupancies.

The SFM is proposing additional amendments that correct the term for “Adult Day Programs”. Legislation amended
Sections 1502, 1523.1, and 1531.2 added Section 1530.1 and repealed Section 1520.2 of the Health and Safety Code.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 8 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Adult day facilities and adult day support centers have been consolidated into a single category called “Adult Day
Program.” The legislation requires the Department of Social Services (DSS) to adopt regulations to combine the existing
categories into this single program, these modifications are to correlate with DSS and implement the legislative revisions
made to Health and Safety Code.

(310.1)

R-3.1

The SFM is proposing to include Group R-2.1 occupancies for clarity to be listed with other occupancies when classifying
a Group R-3 (see additional purpose and rational for Group R-2.1 occupancies above).

(310.2)

R-4

The SFM is proposing to reinstate model code provisions with modification, and include statutory provisions that limit the
number of clients that may be housed in a Group R-4 residential care/assisted living facilities. These limitations are also
coordinated with other occupancy classifications that set a minimum and/or maximum number of clients, including Groups
I-2, 1-4, R-2.1, R-3.1 and R-4 occupancies.

310.2 Definitions

AGED HOME OR INSTITUTION

BEDRIDDEN PERSON

BOARDING HOUSE

CARE AND SUPERVISION

CATASTROPHICALLY INJURED

CHILD-CARE CENTER

CHILD OR CHILDREN

CHRONICALLY ILL

CONGREGATE LIVING HEALTH FACILITY (CLHF)

CONGREGATE LIVING FACILITIES

CONGREGATE RESIDENCE

DAY CARE

DAY-CARE HOME, FAMILY

DAY-CARE HOME, LARGE FAMILY

DAY-CARE HOME, SMALL FAMILY

DORMITORY

FULL-TIME CARE

INFANT

MENTALLY RETARDED PERSONS, PROFOUNDLY OR SEVERELY
NONAMBULATORY PERSONS

PERSONAL CARE SERVICE
RESIDENTAL-CARE/ASSISTED-LMNG-FACILIHES

RESIDENTIAL CARE FACILITY FOR THE CHRONICALLY ILL (RCF/CI)
RESIDENTIAL CARE FACILITY FOR THE ELDERLY (RCFE)
RESIDENTIAL FACILITY (RF)

TERMINALLY ILL

TRANSIENT

Except as identified herein, the above Definitions as amended or California Definitions are brought forward without
modification. The SFM is proposing to include the definition of “DAY-CARE HOME, FAMILY” in accordance with Health
and Safety Code 1596.78. Additional editorial revisions are proposed to correct the term R-3. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

310.3

313

313.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

The actions described above are reasonably necessary to carry out the purpose for which it is proposed. The rationale for
these actions is to establish minimum requirements for the prevention of fire and for the protection of life and property

Office of the State Fire Marshal 9 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



against fire and panic in occupancies that are addressed in the 2009 International Building Code and published as the
2010 California Building Code pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 17921,
and 18949.2.

[4]

CHAPTER 4
SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY

The SFM proposes to adopt Chapter 4 with amendment and California regulation. Furthermore the SFM is maintaining
the adoption of those existing California regulations or Sections as amended in Chapter 4 without modification. The SFM
is proposing adoption of this Chapter with amendment as shown in the corresponding Matrix Adoption Table pursuant to
Health and Safety Code Sections 13108, 13113, 13114, 13131.5, 13143, 13143.6, 17921 and 18949.2.

403

403.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward regarding for high-rise
buildings and I-2 occupancies. Modifications to the existing amendments are editorial only as the existing amendments are
revised to correlate with new model code language. Revisions are made to correct section references for existing high-
rise buildings. There is no change in regulatory effect.

The SFM is further proposing to delete exception 5 of Section 403.1, which exempts Group H occupancies over 75 ft
above the lowest floor level having building access from complying with the high-rise buildings requirements of Sections
403.2 through 403.5. SFM believes that Group H occupancies should have at the minimum, equal or greater fire and life
safety requirements to that of other high-rise building occupancies. As allowed by the building and fire code, Group H
occupancies are allowed to contain, handle and use hazardous materials far in excess of those allowed in all other
occupancies. These hazardous occupancies require more requirements for safe guarding the building occupants and
responding emergency personnel, not less. By deleting this exception Group H occupancies will be required to comply
with high-rise building requirements. This proposed amendment is consistent with the intent of California Health and
Safety Code Section 13211.

403.1.1 Definitions

HIGH-RISE BUILDING

HIGH-RISE BUILDING ACCESS

NEW HIGH-RISE BUILDING

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

403.2

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward with modification. The
SFM is proposing to relocate exception 2 regarding telecommunication equipment and provisions for no automatic sprinkler
protection. This amendment is coordinated with amendments proposed to 903.2 and 903.3.1.1.1, see the purpose and rational
for 903.1.1.1 for additional information.

403.2.1.1

The SFM is proposing to exclude H-1, H-2 or H-3 occupancies from the fire-resistance rating reduction provisions in
coordination with the modifications to Section 403.1. The SFM is proposing to delete exception 5 of Section 403.1, which
exempts Group H-1, H-2 or H-3 occupancies over 75 ft above the lowest floor level having building access from complying
with the high-rise buildings requirements of Sections 403.2 through 403.5. SFM believes that Group H occupancies should
have at the minimum, equal or greater fire and life safety requirements to that of other high-rise building occupancies. As
allowed by the building and fire code, Group H occupancies are allowed to contain, handle and use hazardous materials
far in excess of those allowed in all other occupancies. These hazardous occupancies require more requirements for safe
guarding the building occupants and responding emergency personnel, not less. By deleting this exception Group H-1, H-
2 or H-3 occupancies will be required to comply with high-rise building requirements. This proposed amendment is
consistent with the intent of California Health and Safety Code Section 13211.

403.2.1.1
The SFM is proposing amendments fire-resistance reductions to clarify that the structural frame fire-resistance shall not be
reduced for high-rise buildings. This amendment is consistent with the existing SFM amendments that have been brought

Office of the State Fire Marshal 10 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



forward from Section 403.3.1 and Table 601. There is no change in regulatory effect.

403.4.8.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are being repealed as the model code
provisions of the IBC and IFC now adequately address emergency power loads for dire pumps. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

403:13-403.5.3

4063:-13-1-403.5.3.1

403:13.2-403.5.3.2

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Sections have been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

403.6
The above Section as amended or Section containing California regulations are brought forward with modification.
Editorial revisions are made to correct section references for elevator lobby provisions. There is no change in regulatory
effect.

403:15-403.7

403.12

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Sections have been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

404.6

404.9-404.10

The SFM is including Group R-2.1 occupancy classification to the residential occupancy classification due to the occupancy
reclassification of I-1 occupancies. See the purpose and rational for Section 310.1 for additional information. Sections have
been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in regulatory effect.

405.1
The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Items have been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in regulatory
effect.

406.4.2

406.7

406.7.1

406.7.2

406.7.3

406.7.4

407.1

407.2

407.2.1

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
There is no change in regulatory effect.

407.2.2
The SFM is proposing to repeal existing amendments and correlate these provisions with CCR title 19 and the CFC. The
California Fire Code contains requirements for automatic sprinkler protection and smoke detectors in Chapter 9.

Section 407.2.2, California Building Code inappropriately contains requirements for automatic sprinkler protection and
smoke detectors for nurses’ stations in new construction. Amendments to Section 407.2.2 delete automatic fire sprinkler
protection and smoke detector nurses’ station requirements from this section. New amendments reference the California
Fire Code for automatic fire sprinkler protection in nurses’ stations in existing construction and smoke detectors in nurses’
stations in new and existing construction. Because a new Group | is already required to be protected by automatic fire
sprinklers, specific requirements for automatic sprinkler protection in nurse’s stations in new construction is deleted.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 11 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Section 407.2.2, California Building Code permits the location of nurses’ stations, spaces for doctor’s and nurses’ charting,
communications and related clerical areas to be open to an exit access corridor. In health care facilities where nurses’
stations, doctors’ and nurses’ charting and communications stations are located, it is often necessary to have limited
amounts of combustible storage, paperwork and equipment in these areas to facilitate essential health care activities by
medical personnel. An amendment to 407.2.2 references the requirements of Section 3.11(d) of Title 19 which limits
combustibles and equipment to reasonable quantities. This amendment will provide for coordination with storage and
equipment requirements contained in amended Sec. 3.11(d) of Title 19. Heretofore these requirements have been subject
to varied interpretations and applications by OSHPD, the State Fire Marshal and local fire authorities.

407.3

407.3.1

407.3.1.1

407.3.4

407.4

407.4.2

407.5

407.5.1

407.7

407.8-407.10

407.8-1-407.10.1

407.8.:2-407.10.2

4067.8-3-407.10.3

407.8-4-407.10.4

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Sections have been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

408.1.1 Definition

CELL

CELL

CELL COMPLEX

CELLTHER

CELL TIERS

The SFM is proposing to relocate these existing California definitions for detention facilities from 308.4.6 here to correlate
with the 2009 IBC revised format. Furthermore SFM is removing those IBC definitions that conflict with the existing
California definitions. Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without
modification. There is no change in regulatory effect.

CENTRAL CONTROL BUILDING

The SFM is proposing the definition of Central Control Building to correlate with provisions proposed for fenced enclosures
adjacent to the Central Control Building detention facilities. See purpose and rational for Section 408.3.6.5 for additional
information

DAY ROOM

DORMITORY

HOLDING FACILITY

HOUSING-UNIT

HOUSING UNIT

RESTRAINT

SALLYPORT

The SFM is proposing to relocate these existing California definitions for detention facilities from 308.4.6 here to correlate
with the 2009 IBC revised format. Furthermore SFM is removing those IBC definitions that conflict with the existing
California definitions. Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without
modification. There is no change in regulatory effect.

SMALL MANAGEMENT YARD

The SFM is proposing to include provisions for small management yards in detention facilities. The SFM is proposing
these provisions to provide a safe, adequately protected and code compliant environment for inmates to be provided out of
cell exercise time.

Office of the State Fire Marshal 12 of 47 April 30, 2009
2009 Annual Rulemaking Cycle

Initial Statement of Reasons — CCR, Title 24, Part 2

2010 California Building Code (2009 IBC)



Under California Department of Corrections and Rehabilitation (CDCR) presiding over Title 15, Section 3343, Conditions
of Segregation Housing Unit (ASU) will be provided ten hours per week of out of cell exercise. Judge Karlton, the Coleman
Lawsuit, issued an order directing the CDCR to construct Small Management Yards to meet Title 15 exercise
requirements for ASU inmates by June 30, 2009. An inmate typically occupies these exterior exercise yards approximately
2 hours each day five days a week to satisfy the outside exercise requirements. The exercise currently is comprised of
free movement within an enclosed space of approximately 150 square feet. The inmates have no equipment when they
occupy these yards. These yards are not used to storage of any materials or equipment and there no electrical devices or
outlets accessible to the inmates. The California Building Code does not address the minimum requirements for these
exercise yards. Typically, these yards are located adjacent to 270 housing units, away from the general population
exercise yards.

The occupancy for covered exercise yards is |-3, as any other building within the institution where inmates are confined.
The construction type is Type I-B, with all materials being non-combustible, as follows:

e  Structure: steel posts or steel tubes

e Wall materials: steel plate or steel crimp-lock welded wire mesh

e  Fire proofing of these materials is not required.

Fire alarms and sprinklers should not be required provided the yards are a minimum of 10 feet away from all buildings,
structures or fences, and the yard covering does not exceed 50% of the fenced enclosure.

Officers in charge of yards shall have personal alarms and radios to notify central control in case of fire.

Each yard is to provide exercise for a maximum of two inmates at a time. Exercise yards are 10 foot by 15 foot with a
design minimum of 75 square feet per inmate.

408:1.1-408.1.2

408:9-408.1.2.1

408:10-408.1.2.2

408.2

408.3.1.1

408-3-4-408.3.6

408.3-4.1-408.3.6.1

408-3-4-2-408.3.6.2

408.3-4.3-408.3.6.3

408:3-4-4-408.3.6.4

408.3.6-408.3.8

408-3-6-1-408.3.8.1

408.3.6-2-408.3.8.2

408-11-408.3.9

408.4

408.4.3

The above Sections as amended or Sections containing California regulations are brought forward without modification.
Sections have been renumbered to correlate with the numbering sequence of the 2009 IBC. There is no change in
regulatory effect.

408.3.6.5

The SFM is proposing to include provisions for fenced enclosures for the sub-armory in detention facilities. The fenced
enclosure adjacent to the Central Control Building is a security perimeter for the sub-armory, which is an unmanned
weapons storage structure. Occupancy of this area will only occur during emergency response conditions, with a
maxi